



**JOURNAL of the PROCEEDINGS
of the
CITY COUNCIL**

CITY OF CHARLESTON, WEST VIRGINIA

Regular Meeting – Monday, October 3, 2016

at 7:00 P.M.

Council Chamber – City Hall – Charleston, West Virginia

OFFICIAL RECORD

**Danny Jones
Mayor**

**JB Akers
City Clerk**

CALL TO ORDER

The Council met in the Chambers of the City Building at 7:00 P.M., for the first meeting in the month of October on the 3rd day, in the year 2016, and was called to order by the Honorable Mayor, Danny Jones. The invocation was delivered by Councilman Harrison and the Pledge of Allegiance was led by Councilman Talkington. The Honorable Clerk, JB Akers, called the roll of members and it was found that there were present at the time:

**BURKA
CHESTNUT
EALY
HARRISON
LANE
OVERSTREET
RICHARDSON
SMITH
TALKINGTON**

**BURTON

FAEGRE
HOOVER
MILLER
PERSINGER
SALISBURY**

**CEPERLEY
DAVIS
HAAS
IRELAND
MINARDI
REISHMAN

STEELE
MAYOR JONES**

With twenty-three members being present, the Mayor declared a quorum present.

Pending the reading of the Journal of the previous meeting, the reading thereof was dispensed with and the same duly approved.

PUBLIC SPEAKERS

NONE

CLAIMS

1. A claim of Paula Blackshire, 3911 Washington Avenue South East, Charleston, WV;
Alleges damage to vehicle.
Refer to City Solicitor.

2. A claim of Jennifer Heath, 113 East Ridge Road, Charleston, WV;
Alleges damage to vehicle.
Refer to City Solicitor.

3. A claim of Renita Jones, 5233 Chesterfield Avenue, Charleston, WV;
Alleges damage to vehicle.
Refer to City Solicitor.

4. A claim of Don Sangid, 15 50th Street South East, Charleston, WV;
Alleges damage to personal property .
Refer to City Solicitor.

REPORTS OF COMMITTEES

COMMITTEE ON ORDINANCE AND RULES

1. Your committee on Ordinance and Rules has had under consideration the following bill, and reports the same to Council with the recommendation that Bill No. 7713 do pass.

Bill No. 7713- A Bill to enact Chapter 54, Article V, Sections 54-190 of the Code of the City of Charleston, and to amend Chapter 78, Article IV, Division 1, Section 78-212 of the Code of the City of Charleston for the purpose of regulating fireworks and consumer fireworks within the City of Charleston.

WHEREAS, the City has the general authority and duty to regulate the storage, possession and use of fireworks within the City and to promote and protect the health, safety, and welfare of the public, consistent with W. Va. State Code § 8-12-5 (13), (14), (15), and (44); and

WHEREAS, the West Virginia Legislature, through the passage of House Bill 2852 (2016), repealed and amended several laws related to fireworks and replaced those laws with a new article in West Virginia Code, Fireworks Safety Article 3E in Chapter 29; and

WHEREAS, pursuant to the amended state law, it is now legal to sell fireworks in the state and consumers are now permitted to purchase, store and use fireworks within the state; and

WHEREAS, notwithstanding the amendments to state law authorizing consumer purchase and use of fireworks, West Virginia Code § 29-3E-10 specifically provides municipalities with the authority to prohibit and/or regulate the use of consumer fireworks within municipal boundaries;

Now, therefore, be it Ordained by the Council of the City of Charleston, West Virginia:

That Chapter 54, Article V, Sections 54-190 of the Code of the City of Charleston is hereby enacted to read as follows:

Chapter 54, Article V: Fireworks; Sale, Possession, Storage and Discharge

Sec. 54-190. Generally

(a) The terms used in this Article, including “fireworks” and “consumer fireworks” shall have the same meaning as defined in West Virginia Code Section 29-3E-2. The term fireworks or consumer fireworks shall not include sparkling devices, novelties, toy caps, or model rockets.

(b) The sale, storage, use, possession, ignition, detonation and/or discharge of fireworks within the City of Charleston, shall be subject to, and conducted in a manner consistent with, applicable state law.

Sec. 54-101. Consumer Fireworks; Regulations, Prohibited Actions, and Exceptions

(a) Any person igniting, discharging, detonating or otherwise using (hereinafter, collectively “use” or “using”) consumer fireworks within the City of Charleston and, consistent with W. Va. State Code §8-12-19, within one mile beyond the corporate limits of the City, but not including areas within the corporate limits of another municipality, shall:

(1) not be under the influence of intoxicating liquor, non-intoxicating beer, any controlled substance, or any combination thereof; and

(2) be eighteen years of age or older or shall be under the direct supervision of his or her parent, guardian, or other adult person responsible for the care and custody of the minor; and

(3) be responsible for the prompt removal of all debris resulting from the use of fireworks and such completed removal shall not exceed 24 hours after use; and

(4) be financially responsible for cleanup costs and/or damages resulting from the use of fireworks; and

(5) be responsible for all costs associated with fire suppression efforts related to the use of fireworks; and

(6) not use fireworks within 100 feet of any building or structure unless permission of the owner of the building or structure has been obtained; and

(7) not use fireworks from any motor vehicle or boat; and

(8) store fireworks in a safe, secure and responsible manner, and separate from any possible ignition source; and

(9) use fireworks in a manner designed to ensure that fireworks do not travel through, come in contact with, discharge, or explode onto any public street, highway, sidewalk, or in or upon any building, or at or near any person, or within 500 feet of any location posing a special fire danger, such as a gas station, chemical storage area or other similar location; and

(10) not use fireworks during periods of very high or extreme fire danger as determined by the Charleston Fire Department or the West Virginia Division of Forestry, or while wind

conditions are such that proper fireworks control cannot be exercised; and

(11) not be permitted to use fireworks, except between the hours of 11:00 a.m. and 11:00 p.m., on Memorial Day, Independence Day and Labor Day, or between 11:00 am on December 31 and 1:00 am on January 1; provided, however, that a person may request permission from the Chief of Police to use fireworks for a special event or occasion at other days or times not regularly permitted herein, and the Chief of Police shall have reasonable discretion, on a case by case basis and after consultation with the Chief of the Fire Department, to approve such a request.

(b) This section, and the prohibitions contained herein related to the use of consumer fireworks, is not intended to prohibit use of Display Fireworks within the City at any day or time so long as the use is sponsored or approved by the City.

Sec. 54-102. Enforcement

(a) The City of Charleston may seize, take, remove, dispose of at public auction, or destroy, or cause to be seized, taken, removed, disposed of at public auction, or destroyed, at the expense of the owner, all stocks of fireworks offered for sale, stored, held or used in violation of this section, West Virginia Code, or any emergency or legislative rule promulgated thereunder.

(b) The provisions of this Article shall be enforced by the Chief of Police, or his/her designee, and the Fire Chief, or his/her designee.

(c) Any person convicted of a violation of the provisions of this Article shall be fined not more than five hundred dollars (\$500.00). Each violation of the provisions of this Article shall constitute a separate offense.

(Sec. 54-103. – Sec. 54-110. Reserved)

And be it further Ordained by the Council of the City of Charleston, West Virginia:

That Chapter 78, Article IV, Division 1, Section 78-212 of the Code of the City of Charleston is hereby amended to read as follows:

Chapter 78, Article IV. Offenses Involving Public Peace and Order,
Division 1. Generally
Sec. 78-212. - Noise control.

(a) Declaration of policy. This section is enacted to prevent excessive sound that may jeopardize the health, welfare, or safety of the citizens of Charleston or degrade the quality of life. It is not the intent of this section to interfere unduly with the freedoms of speech or religion.

(b) Definitions. The following words and terms, when used in this section, shall have the following meanings, unless the context clearly indicates otherwise:

City means the jurisdictional limits of the City of Charleston, West Virginia.

Dwelling means a residence or abode, including, but not limited to, a house, mobile-home, condominium, apartment or other structure used as a home.

Dynamic braking system means a device used primarily on trucks for the conversion of the engine from an internal combustion engine to an air compressor for the purpose of braking without the use of wheel brakes, which devices are commonly referred to as "Jacob's brakes" or "jake brakes."

Fireworks as used in this section shall have the same meaning as defined in W. Va. Code Section 29-3E-2, but shall not include sparkling devices, novelties, toy caps, or model rockets.

Motorboat means every description of watercraft, other than a seaplane on the water, used or capable of being used as a means of transportation on water, propelled by an electric, steam, gas, diesel or other fuel propelled or driven by motor, whether or not the motor is the principal source of propulsion, but does not include a boat which has a valid marine document issued by the Bureau of the United States government or any federal agency successor thereto.

Motorcycle means every motor vehicle having a seat or a saddle for the use of the rider and designed to travel on not more than three wheels in contact with the ground, excluding a tractor.

Motor vehicle means any self-propelled vehicle including passenger cars, trucks, truck-trailers, semi-trailers, recreational vehicles, campers and racing vehicles.

Muffler means a properly functioning sound dissipative device or system for abating the sound of escaping gasses on equipment where such a device is part of the normal configuration of the equipment.

Noise means any sound of such character, level or duration: 1) which may be injurious to human health or welfare; or 2) which unreasonably interferes with the enjoyment of life or property throughout the city or in any portion thereof; or 3) which disturbs the good order or quiet of the community; or 4) which annoys or disturbs a reasonable person of normal sensitivity.

(c) Noise prohibited; generally. Subject to the exceptions contained herein, no person shall make, continue or cause to be made any noise as defined herein.

(d) Noise prohibited; motor vehicles, motorcycles, motorboats.

(1) All motor vehicles, motorcycles, and motorboats shall be operated as quietly as possible at all times within the city. No person shall operate any motor vehicle, motorcycle or motorboat in such a manner so as to cause unnecessary noise within the city.

(2) No person operating or occupying a motor vehicle on a street or highway shall amplify from within the motor vehicle the sound produced by a radio, tape player, or other mechanical sound-making device or instrument used for entertainment, so that the sound is plainly audible at a distance of 25 feet or more from the motor vehicle.

(3) No person shall remove or render inoperative, or cause to be removed or rendered inoperative, other than for purposes of maintenance, repair, or replacement, any muffler or sound dissipative device on a motor vehicle, motorcycle or motorboat operated within the city.

(4) No person shall operate, or permit the operation within the city of any motor vehicle,

motorcycle, or motorboat without factory installed mufflers or their equivalent; provided that if no factory installed or equivalent muffler was present at the time of manufacture of the motor vehicle, motorcycle, or motorboat, then sound emanating from the motor vehicle, motorcycle, or motorboat shall be effectively muffled in a reasonable manner by equipment so constructed and used to muffle sound.

(5) No person shall use a muffler cutout, bypass, or similar device upon a motor vehicle or motorcycle operated within the city.

(6) No person in actual physical control of a motor vehicle within the city shall use a dynamic braking system unless said use is necessary to prevent or avoid an accident that may cause property damage, injury, or loss of life. This provision shall not apply to fire trucks or other emergency vehicles equipped with a dynamic braking system.

(e) Noise prohibited; dwelling.

(1) No person occupying a dwelling within the city shall amplify from within the dwelling the sound produced by a radio, tape player, television or other mechanical sound-making device or instrument used for the purposes of entertainment, so that the sound is plainly audible at a distance of 25 feet or more from the dwelling.

(f) Exemptions.

(1) The following are exempt from the provisions of this section:

a. Noise resulting from emergency or necessary maintenance work as performed by the City of Charleston, State of West Virginia or its political subdivisions, or public utility companies, including, but not limited to, any work of any kind on roads, streets, bridges, alleys, rights-of-way or government owned property;

b. Noise resulting from any emergency vehicle, when responding to an emergency call or acting in time of emergency, or during training exercises and maintenance;

c. Noise from emergency signaling devices except as provided in subsection 78-212(f)(1)d., herein;

d. Noise from a burglar or fire alarm installed on any building, motor vehicle or other property so long as the alarm terminates its operation within five minutes of its activation; provided that it shall be deemed reasonable for an activated alarm to continue to operate if a crime or fire is in progress at or near the property and/or until law enforcement or other emergency personnel have responded to a legitimate call for assistance related in any way to the property at which the activated alarm is located;

e. Noise from domestic power tools, landscaping and yard maintenance equipment, and agricultural equipment when operated between the hours of 7:00 a.m. and 9:00 p.m. on weekdays and between the hours of 8:00 a.m. and 9:00 p.m. on weekends and legal holidays;

f. Noise from commercial or industrial power tools, landscaping and yard maintenance equipment, and agricultural equipment on a residential property or within 250 feet of a residential property line when operated on commercial or industrial property, between the hours of 7:00 a.m. and 9:00 p.m. on weekdays and between the hours of 8:00 a.m. and 9:00 p.m. on weekends and legal holidays;

g. Noise from church bells and chimes when used as part of a religious observance or service

or for national celebrations or public holidays, and those bells and chimes that are presently installed and in use, provided said use is reasonable and for a church related purpose;

h. Noise generated during the normal course of business by any properly licensed commercial or industrial enterprise operating lawfully within an area properly zoned for said enterprise, unless or until said lawful business use is deemed abandoned as a matter of law or fact;

i. Noise from construction, drilling, earthmoving, excavating, or demolition activity provided all motorized equipment used in such activity is equipped with functioning mufflers;

j. Noise from snow blowers, snow throwers, and snow plows when operated with a muffler for the purpose of snow removal;

k. Noise generated in situations within the jurisdiction of the Federal Occupational Safety and Health Administration;

l. Noise generated from city sponsored or approved celebrations or events, including, but not limited to, parades, outdoor concerts, and athletic events;

m. Noise generated from secondary school and higher education sponsored or approved celebrations or events, including, but not limited to, outdoor concerts or band festivals and outdoor athletic events and practices;

n. Noise produced by a governmental body or employee in the performance of a governmental function;

o. Noise generated from athletic events or practices;

p. Noise generated from airplanes at Yeager Airport;

q. Noise generated from railroads within the city;

r. Noise generated from events at the civic center or municipal auditorium;

s. Noise generated from the ignition, discharge, detonation or other use of fireworks when such use is sponsored or approved-authorized by the city; and

t. Noise generated from events promoted by the Charleston Convention and Visitors Bureau.

u. Noise generated by the ignition, discharge, detonation, or other use of fireworks between 11:00 a.m. and 11:00 p.m. on Memorial Day, Independence Day and Labor Day, or between 11:00 a.m. on December 31 and 1:00 a.m. on January 1, or at such other day or time as may be approved by the Chief of Police to the extent permitted by this Code.

(2) For purposes of the exemptions contained in subsection 78-212(f)(1)l. and m., all celebrations and events held at Appalachian Power Park and University of Charleston Stadium at Laidley Field are presumed to be city sponsored or approved or secondary school and higher education approved. FestivAll, Live on the Levee, Doo-Wop and Rod Run, Symphony Sunday, The Wine and Jazz Festival, and Multifest, ~~and all Charleston Sternwheel Regatta events~~ are also presumed to be "city sponsored or approved" and are specifically exempt from the foregoing prohibitions. The list of presumed city sponsored or approved and secondary school and higher education approved celebrations and events listed under this subsection is not intended to be exclusive.

(g) Enforcement. Any person found guilty of violating section 78-212, as defined herein shall

be punished by a fine as follows: \$100.00 for the first offense within a 24 month period; \$200 dollars for a second offense within a 24-month period; \$300.00 dollars for a third offense within a 24-month period; \$400.00 dollars for a fourth offense within a 24-month period and \$500.00 dollars for the fifth and each subsequent offense within a 24-month period. If the violation is of a continuing nature, each day during which it occurs shall constitute an additional, separate, and distinct offense.

(h) Severability.

(1) If any provision or portion of a provision of this section is held to be unconstitutional, preempted by federal or state law, or otherwise invalid by any court of competent jurisdiction, the remaining provisions of the section shall not be invalidated.

(2) All ordinances or parts of ordinances which are materially inconsistent with any provisions of this section are hereby repealed as to the extent of any such material inconsistency.

Pursuant to Chapter 41 of the Charter of the City of Charleston, this ordinance shall take effect immediately upon adoption by City Council if passed by three-fifths of the elected members or shall take effect five days after adoption if passed by less than three-fifths of the elected members.

Councilman Harrison moved to approve the Bill. Councilman Lane seconded the motion. A roll call was taken:

YEAS: Burka, Burton, Ceperley, Chestnut, Davis, Ealy, Faegre, Haas, Harrison, Hoover, Ireland, Lane, Miller, Minardi, Overstreet, Persinger, Reishman, Richardson, Salisbury, Smith, Steele, Talkington, Mayor Jones

NAYS: NONE

ABSENT: Clowser, Slater, Snodgrass, Ware

With a majority of members elected recorded thereon as voting in the affirmative the Mayor declared Bill No. 7713 passed.

COMMITTEE ON FINANCE

Councilman Reishman, Chair of the Council Committee on Finance, submitted the following reports:

1. Your committee on Finance has had under consideration the following resolution, and reports the same to Council with the recommendation that Resolution No. 803-16 do pass.

Resolution No. 803-16: Authorizing the Mayor or City Manager to Receive and administer \$40,000 from the WV Division of Justice and Community Service to reimburse partial salaries for the Prevention Resource Officers at Stonewall Middle School and Capital High School.

Be it Resolved by the Council of the City of Charleston, West Virginia:

That the Mayor or his designee is hereby authorized and directed to receive and administer \$40,000 from the WV Division of Justice and Community Service to reimburse partial salaries for the Prevention Resource Officers at Stonewall Middle School and Capital High School.

Councilman Reishman moved to approve the Resolution. Councilman Lane seconded the motion. With a majority of members elected recorded thereon as voting in the affirmative the Mayor declared Resolution 803-16 adopted.

2. Your committee on Finance has had under consideration the following resolution, and reports the same to Council with the recommendation that Resolution No. 804-16 do pass.

Resolution No. 804-16: Authorizing the Mayor or City Manager to Receive and administer \$69,000 from the WV Division of Justice and Community Service to reimburse partial salaries for four MDENT Drug Unit officers from Charleston PD, Nitro PD, South Charleston PD and St. Albans PD.

Be it Resolved by the Council of the City of Charleston, West Virginia:

That the Mayor or his designee is hereby authorized and directed to receive and administer \$69,000 from the WV Division of Justice and Community Service to reimburse partial salaries for four MDENT Drug Unit officers from Charleston PD, Nitro PD, South Charleston PD and St. Albans PD.

Councilman Reishman moved to approve the Resolution. Councilman Lane seconded the motion. With a majority of members elected recorded thereon as voting in the affirmative the Mayor declared Resolution 804-16 adopted.

3. Your committee on Finance has had under consideration the following resolution, and reports the same to Council with the recommendation that Resolution No. 805-16 do pass.

Resolution No. 805-16: Authorizing the Mayor or City Manager to Receive and administer \$36,600 from the WV Division of Justice and Community Service to reimburse partial salary for the Charleston Police Department's Crime Victims Advocate and provide travel/training funds.

Be it Resolved by the Council of the City of Charleston, West Virginia:

That the Mayor or his designee is hereby authorized and directed to receive and administer \$36,600 from the WV Division of Justice and Community Service to reimburse partial salary for the Charleston Police Department's Crime Victims Advocate and provide travel/training funds.

Councilman Reishman moved to approve the Resolution. Councilman Lane seconded the motion. With a majority of members elected recorded thereon as voting in the affirmative the Mayor declared Resolution 805-16 adopted.

4. Your committee on Finance has had under consideration the following resolution, and reports the same to Council with the recommendation that Resolution No. 806-16 do pass.

Resolution No. 806-16: Authorizing the Mayor or City Manager to Approve an addendum for an extension to the Agreement between the City of Charleston and Kim Mitchell, Project Director for the Drug Market Intervention grant through the Charleston Police Department. The contract will extend to September 30, 2017 for the amount \$19,320.00.

Be it Resolved by the Council of the City of Charleston, West Virginia:

That the Mayor or his designee is hereby authorized and directed to Approve an addendum for an extension to the Agreement between the City of Charleston and Kim Mitchell, Project Director for the Drug Market Intervention grant through the Charleston Police Department. The contract will extend to September 30, 2017 for the amount \$19,320.00.

Councilman Reishman moved to approve the Resolution. Councilman Ware seconded the motion. With a majority of members elected recorded thereon as voting in the affirmative the Mayor declared Resolution 806-16 adopted.

5. Your committee on Finance has had under consideration the following resolution, and reports the same to Council with the recommendation that Resolution No. 807-16 do pass.

Resolution No. 807-16: Authorizing the Mayor or City Manager to Approve an addendum for an extension to the Agreement between the City of Charleston and WV Division of Justice and Community Services Office of Research and Strategic Planning for crime data research for the Drug Market Intervention grant through the Charleston Police Department. The contract will extend to September 30, 2017 for the amount of \$37,398.41.

Be it Resolved by the Council of the City of Charleston, West Virginia:

That the Mayor or his designee is hereby authorized and directed to approve an addendum for an extension to the Agreement between the City of Charleston and WV Division of Justice and Community Services Office of Research and Strategic Planning for crime data research for the Drug Market Intervention grant through the Charleston Police Department. The contract will extend to September 30, 2017 for the amount of \$37,398.41.

Councilman Reishman moved to approve the Resolution. Councilman Ware seconded the motion. With a majority of members elected recorded thereon as voting in the affirmative the Mayor declared Resolution 807-16 adopted.

6. Your committee on Finance has had under consideration the following resolution, and reports the same to Council with the recommendation that Resolution No. 808-16 do pass.

Resolution No. 808-16: Authorizing the Mayor or City Manager to approve an addendum for an extension to the Agreement between the City of Charleston and Kingery and Company for the fulfillment of a marketing plan for the Drug Market Intervention grant through the Charleston Police Department. The contract will extend to September 30, 2017 for the amount of \$20,700.00.

Be it Resolved by the Council of the City of Charleston, West Virginia:

That the Mayor or his designee is hereby authorized and directed to approve an addendum for an extension to the Agreement between the City of Charleston and Kingery and Company for the fulfillment of a marketing plan for the Drug Market Intervention grant through the Charleston Police Department. The contract will extend to September 30, 2017 for the amount of \$20,700.00.

Councilman Reishman moved to approve the Resolution. Councilman Ware seconded the motion. With a majority of members elected recorded thereon as voting in the affirmative the Mayor declared Resolution 808-16 adopted.

7. Your committee on Finance has had under consideration the following resolution, and reports the same to Council with the recommendation that Resolution No. 809-16 do pass.

Resolution No. 809-16: Authorizing the Mayor or City Manager to enter into an Agreement with L & L Contracting, in the amount of \$75,409.06, for the Holz Elementary Safe Routes to School Project.

Be it Resolved by the Council of the City of Charleston, West Virginia:

That the Mayor or City Manager is hereby authorized and directed to enter into an Agreement with L & L Contracting, in the amount of \$75,409.06, for the Holz Elementary Safe Routes to School Project.

Holz Elementary Safe Routes to School Project
 Bid Opening: September 22, 2016 @ 2 p.m.

				Garcie R. Marker & Sons, Inc. 1119 Jefferson Road South Charleston, WV 25309 P: (304) 744-0590 gmarkersons@aol.com		L&L Contracting WV Inc. P.O. Box 151 Sand Fork, WV 26430 P: (304) 295-5592 RLKL@lbrmotors.com		McClanahan Construction Co. LLC 744 Pocahontas River Road N. Poca, WV 25159 P: (304) 776-3355 bruce@mcclanahanconstruction.com		Shamblin Construction Inc. 792 Call Road Charleston, WV 25312 P: (304) 984-1948 shamblincons@aol.com	
WVDOH ITEM NO.	ITEM	UNIT	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	PRICE PER UNIT	TOTAL COST	PRICE PER UNIT	TOTAL COST	PRICE PER UNIT	TOTAL COST	PRICE PER UNIT	TOTAL COST
204001-000	Mobilization	LS	1	\$750.00	\$750.00	\$10,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$3,847.00	\$3,847.00		\$1,500.00
228001-000	Subgrade Preparation	SY	235	\$16.00	\$3,760.00	\$10.00	\$2,350.00	\$11.00	\$2,585.00		\$5,000.00
207034-000	Fabric for Separation	SY	230	\$4.00	\$920.00	\$9.00	\$2,070.00	\$3.00	\$690.00		\$650.00
307001-000	Aggregate Base Course, Class 1	CY	41	\$65.00	\$2,665.00	\$61.00	\$2,501.00	\$75.00	\$3,075.00		\$6,700.00
402001-020	Marshall HMA SKID PVT, SG, TY	TN	10	\$250.00	\$2,500.00	\$200.00	\$2,000.00	\$250.00	\$2,500.00		\$1,000.00
415005-001	Existing Pavement Removal	LS	1	\$5,175.00	\$5,175.00	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$6,400.00	\$6,400.00		\$6,500.00
601002-001	Class B Concrete Wall	CY	39	\$700.00	\$27,300.00	\$128.00	\$4,992.00	\$869.00	\$33,891.00		\$21,000.00
602001-001	Reinforcing Steel Bar	LB	2577	\$2.00	\$5,154.00	\$0.78	\$2,010.06	\$3.00	\$7,731.00		\$6,000.00
605004-001	Type B Inlet	EA	1	\$3,500.00	\$3,500.00	\$2,500.00	\$2,500.00	\$2,100.00	\$2,100.00		\$950.00
605012-001	Adjust Inlet Type	EA	1	\$850.00	\$850.00	\$500.00	\$500.00	\$870.00	\$870.00		\$350.00
605020-001	Install Inlet Grate	EA	1	\$350.00	\$350.00	\$500.00	\$500.00	\$400.00	\$400.00		\$800.00
609001-001	Concrete Sidewalk	SY	230	\$150.00	\$34,500.00	\$125.00	\$28,750.00	\$98.50	\$22,655.00		\$39,000.00
609005-001	Curb Ramp	EA	2	\$1,000.00	\$2,000.00	\$750.00	\$1,500.00	\$1,220.00	\$2,440.00		\$12,000.00
609006-001	Detectable Warning Surface	EA	2	\$250.00	\$500.00	\$300.00	\$600.00	\$250.00	\$500.00		\$490.00
610001-001	Concrete Curb - Type 1	LF	30	\$30.00	\$900.00	\$50.00	\$1,500.00	\$45.00	\$1,350.00		\$1,900.00
636011-001	Traffic Control	LS	1	\$17,855.00	\$17,855.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00		\$1,500.00
639001-001	Construction Layout Stake	LS	1	\$1,120.00	\$1,120.00	\$200.00	\$200.00	\$730.00	\$730.00		\$500.00
640001-001	Storage Building	LS	1	\$100.00	\$100.00	\$100.00	\$100.00	\$100.00	\$100.00		\$0.00
642004-003	Seed Mixture, Temporary	LS	1	\$100.00	\$100.00	\$700.00	\$700.00	\$1,900.00	\$1,900.00		\$800.00
657010-001	3.00 LB Channel Post	LF	22	\$5.00	\$110.00	\$13.00	\$286.00	\$8.50	\$187.00		\$150.00
657018-001	Post Removal	EA	2	\$10.00	\$20.00	\$50.00	\$100.00	\$75.00	\$150.00		\$75.00
661011-001	Installation of Reusable Sign	EA	2	\$25.00	\$50.00	\$100.00	\$200.00	\$50.00	\$100.00		\$300.00
663005-010	Stop Line, Type V - 12" (White)	LF	6	\$15.00	\$90.00	\$50.00	\$300.00	\$25.00	\$150.00		\$200.00
663006-010	Crosswalk Line, Type V - 12" (White)	LF	100	\$15.00	\$1,500.00	\$50.00	\$5,000.00	\$25.00	\$2,500.00		\$800.00
672002-002	Mailbox Relocations	EA	3	\$150.00	\$450.00	\$250.00	\$750.00	\$75.00	\$225.00		\$300.00
TOTAL PROJECT COST					\$112,219.00		\$75,409.06		\$102,076.00		\$108,465.00
UNIT PRICE NO. 1					\$17.00/sq.ft.		\$14.00/sq. ft.		\$16.00/sq. ft.		\$45.00/sq. ft.
UNIT PRICE NO. 2					\$20.00/sq. ft.		\$20.00/sq. ft.		\$17.50/sq. ft.		\$45.00/sq. ft.
DEDUCTIVE ALTERNATE NO. 1					(\$27,300.00)		(\$9,000.00)		(\$43,722.00)		(\$22,000.00)

Councilman Reishman moved to approve the Resolution. Councilman Ware seconded the motion. With a majority of members elected recorded thereon as voting in the affirmative the Mayor declared Resolution 809-16 adopted.

8. Your committee on Finance has had under consideration the following resolution, and reports the same to Council with the recommendation that Resolution No. 810-16 do pass.

Resolution No. 810-16: Authorizing the Finance Director to amend the FY 2016-2017 General Fund budget as indicated on the attached list of accounts.

Be it Resolved by the Council of the City of Charleston, West Virginia:

That the Finance Director is hereby authorized and directed to amend the FY 2016-2017 General Fund budget as indicated on the attached list of accounts.

General Fund FY 2016-2017 Budget Amendment No. 04 - October 3, 2016

Account No.	Department	Account Description	Amount
001 976 00 706 4 459	Fire	Capital Outlay - Equipment	69,111
001 699 00 000 5 598	Contingency		(69,111)
To partially fund the purchase of Fire Department pumper truck. The remainder will be funded by insurance proceeds previously received from BRIT Insurance Services USA under the City's Property Damage coverage.			
001 712 00 000 1 103	Traffic Engineering	Wages & Salaries - Pro Pay	(12,000)
001 754 00 000 1 103	Equipment Maintenance	Wages & Salaries - Pro Pay	(12,000)
001 699 00 000 5 598	Contingency		29,000
To eliminate Pro Pay in conjunction with the new compensation plan.			

Reportable: To Maintain compliance with the budgetary guidelines of the State of West Virginia

Councilman Reishman moved to approve the Bill. Councilman Lane seconded the motion. A roll call was taken:

YEAS: Burka, Burton, Ceperley, Chestnut, Davis, Ealy, Faegre, Haas, Harrison, Hoover, Ireland, Lane, Miller, Minardi, Overstreet, Persinger, Reishman, Richardson, Salisbury, Smith, Steele, Talkington, Mayor Jones

NAYS: NONE

ABSENT: Clowser, Slater, Snodgrass, Ware

With a majority of members elected recorded thereon as voting in the affirmative the Mayor declared Resolution No. 810-16 adopted.

9. Your committee on Finance has had under consideration the following resolution, and reports the same to Council with the recommendation that Resolution No. 811-16 do pass.

Resolution No. 811-16: Authorizing the Mayor or City Manager to enter into an agreement with GAI Consultants, Inc. in the amount of \$18,500 for engineering services for the Magic Island trail terminus and overlook project which is the terminus of the proposed bike trail running along Kanawha Boulevard and extending from Magic Island Park to Patrick Street.

Be it Resolved by the Council of the City of Charleston, West Virginia:

That the Mayor or City Manager is hereby authorized and directed to enter into an agreement with GAI Consultants, Inc. in the amount of \$18,500 for engineering services for the Magic Island trail terminus and overlook project which is the terminus of the proposed bike trail running along Kanawha Boulevard and extending from Magic Island Park to Patrick Street.

Councilman Reishman moved to approve the Resolution. Councilman Ware seconded the motion. With a majority of members elected recorded thereon as voting in the affirmative the Mayor declared Resolution 811-16 adopted.

10. Your committee on Finance has had under consideration the following resolution, and reports the same to Council with the recommendation that Resolution No. 812-16 do pass.

Resolution No. 812-16: Authorizing the City Manager to execute Change Order No. 2 with Terradon Corporation in the amount of \$17,710.00 for the modified scope of services described in Exhibit A for a total not to exceed \$563,560.00.

Be it Resolved by the Council of the City of Charleston, West Virginia:

That the City Manager is hereby authorized and directed to execute Change Order No. 2 with Terradon Corporation in the amount of \$17,710.00 for the modified scope of services described in Exhibit A for a total not to exceed \$563,560.00.

EXHIBIT A
To AIA G802-2007 dated October 3, 2016,
Amendment Number 002 to the Professional Services Agreement
Between the City of Charleston and Terradon Corporation
For the Charleston Civic Center Expansion and Renovation

A. GENERAL

This is Amendment Number 002 to the Professional Services Agreement between the City of Charleston and Terradon Corporation dated October 13, 2015, (hereinafter, the "Agreement") related to the Charleston Civic Center Expansion and Renovation. On the AIA G802-2007 the word "Architect" shall mean "Consultant"

B. AMENDED SCOPE OF SERVICES

Consistent with, and for the reasons set forth in the September 14, 2016, email from Joe Saunders to Lloyd Miller attached hereto, the Scope of Services of the Agreement is hereby modified as follows:

1. Estimated time for lab analysis of fire proofing density is being added to the scope of services with an estimated 100 hours at the rate of \$50.00 per hour resulting in an estimated additional \$5,000.00.
2. The estimated number of tests of concrete cylinder compression is increased by 200 for a total of 600 tests at a rate of \$20.00 per test resulting in an estimated additional \$4,000.00.
3. The estimated number of tests of mortar cube compression is increased by 350 for a total of 410 tests at a rate of \$18.00 per test resulting in an estimated additional \$6,300.00
4. Testing for floor flatness is being added to the scope of services with an estimated 6 tests at a rate of \$400.00 per test for an estimated additional \$2,400.00.
5. The estimated hours for Level IV Inspector is being reduced from 732 to 100 at a rate of \$120.00 per hour for an estimate reduction of \$75,840.00.
6. The estimated hours for Level II I Inspector is being increased from 4,620 to 6,137 at a rate of \$50.00 per hour for an estimated additional \$75,850.00.

The change to the estimated Total Contract Amount from this Amendment Number 002 is \$17,710.00

C. TOTAL CONTRACT AMOUNT

Subject to the terms of the Agreement, the City agrees to pay Consultant, and Consultant agrees to accept as payment for Services a sum no greater than:

Original Total Contract Amount per the Agreement:	\$ 496,400
Amendment Number 001 (Sanitary Sewer relocation):	49,450
Amendment Number 002:	17,710
Revised Total Contract Amount not to exceed:	\$563,560

D. OTHER TERM AND CONDITIONS

All other terms and conditions of the Agreement not specifically amended by this Amendment Number 002 remain in full force and effect.

Councilman Reishman moved to approve the Resolution. Councilman Ware seconded the motion. With a majority of members elected recorded thereon as voting in the affirmative the Mayor declared Resolution 812-16 adopted.

11. Your committee on Finance has had under consideration the following resolution, and reports the same to Council with the recommendation that Resolution No. 813-16 do pass.

Resolution No. 813-16: Authorizing the City Manager to execute Change Order No. 1 with Garcie R. Marker & Sons, Inc. in the amount of \$42,395.00 for the modified scope of services described in Exhibit A, attached hereto. Change Order No. 1 provides for replacing curb and sidewalk in the 800 block of Grant Street (south side only), 1600 Block of Fourth Avenue (south side only), and completing the 800 Block of Main Street. The change order increases the contract price from \$207,545.00 to \$249,940.00.

Be it Resolved by the Council of the City of Charleston, West Virginia:

That the City Manager is hereby authorized and directed to execute Change Order No. 1 with Garcie R. Marker & Sons, Inc. in the amount of \$42,395.00 for the modified scope of services described in Exhibit A, attached hereto. Change Order No. 1 provides for replacing curb and sidewalk in the 800 block of Grant Street (south side only), 1600 Block of Fourth Avenue (south side only), and completing the 800 Block of Main Street. The change order increases the contract price from \$207,545.00 to \$249,940.00.

**CONCRETE CURB AND SIDEWALK PROJECT
SUMMER 2016**

PROJECT NUMBER E2 05/16-101

Change Order No.1

September 26, 2016

This change order will consist of replacing curb and sidewalk in the 800 Bl. of Grant St. (South Side Only), 1600 Bl. of 4th Ave. (South Side Only) and finishing the 800 Bl. of Main St.

Sidewalk Replacement (Approx.) 3350.00 s.f. @ \$11.00/s.f. \$ 36,850.00

Plain Curb (Approx.) 650.00 l.f. @ \$6.00/l.f. \$ 3,900.00

Integral Curb (Approx.) 95.00 l.f. @ \$11.00/l.f. \$ 1,045.00

Truncated Domes 4 Ea. @ \$150.00 \$ 600.00

Total: \$ 42,395.00

Original Contract Price.....\$207,545.00

Change Order No.1 Price.....\$42,395.00

New Contract Price\$249,940.00

**THE CITY OF CHARLESTON, GARCIE R. MARKER & SONS, INC.
a municipal corporation**

Councilman Reishman moved to approve the Resolution. Councilman Ware seconded the motion. With a majority of members elected recorded thereon as voting in the affirmative the Mayor declared Resolution 813-16 adopted.

12. Your committee on Finance has had under consideration the following resolution, and reports the same to Council with the recommendation that Resolution No. 814-16 do pass.

Resolution No. 814-16: Authorizing the Mayor or City Manager to enter into an agreement with Cintas Corporation for purchase of employee uniforms for the Public Works Department. The Agreement is for a one year term.

Funds for the uniforms are available in the uniform line item for various divisions of the Public Works Department.

Industrial Grade Uniforms

Bid Opening September 27, 2016 @ 11:00 a.m.

Item	Make	Unit Cost	Workingman's Store 140 3rd Avenue Hills, WV 25771 P: (304) 553-0873 www.workingmansstore.com	Charleston Department Store 1081 Washington St. West Charleston, WV 25307 P: (304) 346-4793 www.charlestondepartmentstore.com	R. Silveira Corp 1505 MacCordle Avenue Martinsburg, WV 25801 P: (304) 727-1800 www.rsilveira.com
Industrial Grade Pants, Long	Red Kap Men's Red Kap Women's	\$15.00 \$15.00	Red Kap	Red Kap Navy Carhartt Navy	Red Kap Navy Red Kap Navy
Industrial Grade Pants, Short	(Not Stated)		Red Kap	Carhartt Jean Carhartt Jean	Red Kap Carhartt Jean
Industrial Grade Long-Sleeve Shirts w/ Embroidered Patch, Navy	Red Kap	\$24.00	Red Kap	Carhartt Dungsaree Carhartt Dungsaree	Red Kap Red Kap
Industrial Grade Long-Sleeve Shirts w/ Embroidered Patch, Red	Red Kap	\$24.00	Red Kap	Carhartt Navy Carhartt Navy	Red Kap Red Kap
Industrial Grade Long-Sleeve Shirts w/ Embroidered Patch, Safety Yellow	Red Kap	\$22.00	Red Kap	Carhartt Carhartt	Red Kap Red Kap
Industrial Grade Short-Sleeve Shirts w/ Embroidered Patch, Navy	Red Kap	\$22.00	Red Kap	Carhartt Carhartt	Red Kap Red Kap
Industrial Grade Short-Sleeve Shirts w/ Embroidered Patch, Red	Red Kap	\$22.00	Red Kap	Carhartt Carhartt	Red Kap Red Kap
Industrial Grade Short-Sleeve Shirts w/ Embroidered Patch, Safety Yellow	Red Kap	\$20.00	Red Kap	Carhartt Carhartt	Red Kap Red Kap
Industrial Grade Hooded Jackets w/ Embroidered Patch, Navy	Majestic	\$50.00	Red Kap	Carhartt**	Dickies Dickies
Industrial Grade Hooded Jackets w/ Embroidered Patch, Red	Majestic	\$50.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Industrial Grade Hooded Jackets w/ Embroidered Patch, Safety Yellow	Majestic	\$48.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Industrial Grade Golf Knit Shirts w/ Silk Screen Logo, Navy	Competition	\$28.00	Red Kap	Carhartt*	Game Port Authority
Industrial Grade Golf Knit Shirts w/ Silk Screen Logo, Red	Competition	\$28.00	No Bid	Carhartt*	Port Authority Port Authority
Industrial Grade T-Shirts w/ Silk Screen Logo, Navy	Red Kap	\$18.00	Olden	Carhartt*	Jerzees Jerzees
Industrial Grade T-Shirts w/ Silk Screen Logo, Red	Red Kap	\$18.00	Olden	Carhartt*	Jerzees Jerzees
Industrial Grade T-Shirts w/ Silk Screen Logo, Safety Yellow	Red Kap	\$16.00	Olden	Carhartt*	Jerzees Jerzees
Hooded Sweatshirts w/ Silk Screen Logo, Navy	Port & Co.	\$32.00	Carhartt	Carhartt*	Sport Trk Heavy Sport Trk Heavy
Hooded Sweatshirts w/ Silk Screen Logo, Red	Port & Co.	\$32.00	Carhartt	Carhartt*	Sport Trk Heavy Sport Trk Heavy
Hooded Sweatshirts w/ Silk Screen Logo, Safety Yellow	Port & Co.	\$30.00	No Bid	Carhartt*	Sport Trk Heavy Sport Trk Heavy
Industrial Grade Coveralls (Invisible)	Carhartt	\$55.00	Red Cap	Carhartt* Brown Carhartt* Navy	Dickies Dickies
Industrial Wear Rain Gear	(Not Stated)	\$16.50	(Not Stated)	Carhartt	Nessee Nessee
Baseball Caps (Summer & Winter) w/ Silk Screen Logo, Navy	(Not Stated)	\$14.50	n/a	Carhartt	Head to Toe Head to Toe
Baseball Caps (Summer & Winter) w/ Silk Screen Logo, Safety Yellow	(Not Stated)	\$12.50	n/a	Carhartt	Port Authority Port Authority
2" Embroidered City of Charleston Patch, One-time cost	n/a	Included Above	n/a	n/a	n/a
2 1/2" Silk Screened City of Charleston Logo, One-time cost	n/a	Included Above	n/a	n/a	n/a
1 3/4" Silk Screened City of Charleston Logo, One-time cost	n/a	Included Above	n/a	n/a	n/a
Extra Charge for Navy Items	n/a	Included Above	n/a	n/a	n/a
Extra Charge for Red Items	n/a	Included Above	n/a	n/a	n/a
Delivery		30 days	30-45 days	1-14 days	2 weeks
Other Pricing/Delivery Notes	Min. Order: Screenprint 24 per same size & color logo. Min. Order Embroidery 12 per same size & color logo.	Estimated 24 per same size & color logo. Min. Order Industrial Jacket: No Hood Hooded Sweatshirt, Dark Color	Estimated Sizes: 20% increase on all Industrial Jacket: No Hood Hooded Sweatshirt, Dark Color	*Extended Size Extra **Color: Black	Delivery Times are Estimates \$5 alteration fee/garment may apply Add. Fee for Dept. Logos may apply

Councilman Reishman moved to approve the Resolution. Councilman Ware seconded the motion. With a majority of members elected recorded thereon as voting in the affirmative the Mayor declared Resolution 814-16 adopted.

13. Your committee on Finance has had under consideration the following resolution, and reports the same to Council with the recommendation that Resolution No. 815-16 do pass.

Resolution No. 815-16: Authorizing the Mayor or City Manager to enter into an Agreement with Asphalt Contractors & Site Work Inc., in the amount of \$198,043.35 for the 42nd Street Streetscape Improvements Project.

To be charged to Account No. 220-975-00-420-4-458, General Maintenance Fund – Major Improvements

42nd Street Streetscape Project
 Bid Opening: September 27, 2016 @ 10 a.m.

ITEM NO.	ITEM	UNIT	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	Asphalt Contractors & Site Work Inc.		Wolf Creek Contracting Co. LLC		McClanahan Construction Co. LLC	
				PRICE PER UNIT	TOTAL COST	PRICE PER UNIT	TOTAL COST	PRICE PER UNIT	TOTAL COST
1	Mobilization	LS	1	\$10,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$26,589.00	\$26,589.00	\$9,700.00	\$9,700.00
2	Temporary Traffic Control	LS	1	\$2,500.00	\$2,500.00	\$6,577.10	\$6,577.10	\$4,470.00	\$4,470.00
3	Selective Site Demolition	LS	1	\$11,700.00	\$11,700.00	\$52,360.00	\$52,360.00	\$27,608.00	\$27,608.00
4	Miscellaneous Utility Adjustments	LS	1	\$1,050.00	\$1,050.00	\$10,710.00	\$10,710.00	\$1,485.00	\$1,485.00
5	Storm Sewer Line (6")	LF	6	\$100.00	\$600.00	\$297.50	\$1,785.00	\$70.00	\$420.00
6	Storm Sewer Line (12")	LF	130	\$40.00	\$5,200.00	\$65.45	\$8,508.50	\$99.00	\$12,870.00
7	Type "B" Storm Inlet	EA	2	\$4,200.00	\$8,400.00	\$4,165.00	\$8,330.00	\$2,490.00	\$4,980.00
8	Type "B" Modified Storm Inlet	EA	2	\$5,700.00	\$11,400.00	\$5,355.00	\$10,710.00	\$4,970.00	\$9,940.00
9	Connection to Power	LS	1	\$6,094.00	\$6,094.00	\$6,592.60	\$6,592.60	\$4,200.00	\$4,200.00
10	Pole Lights w/Concrete Base, etc.	EA	4	\$3,439.75	\$13,759.00	\$2,558.50	\$10,234.00	\$7,500.00	\$30,000.00
11	Concrete Sidewalk	SF	1260	\$12.65	\$15,939.00	\$14.23	\$17,929.80	\$10.65	\$13,419.00
12	Vehicular Brick Pavers in Crosswalk	SF	460	\$29.66	\$13,643.60	\$70.61	\$32,480.60	\$49.75	\$22,885.00
13	Concrete Paver Truncated Domes	SF	92	\$30.00	\$2,760.00	\$93.45	\$8,597.40	\$55.00	\$5,060.00
14	6" Concrete Curbing	LF	625	\$56.55	\$35,343.75	\$24.72	\$15,450.00	\$35.00	\$21,875.00
15	Asphalt Pavement	SF	8400	\$3.49	\$29,316.00	\$3.28	\$27,552.00	\$2.75	\$23,100.00
16	Bicycle Rack	EA	1	\$800.00	\$800.00	\$730.87	\$730.87	\$760.00	\$760.00
17	Bumper Blocks (new)	EA	13	\$45.00	\$585.00	\$99.68	\$1,295.84	\$100.00	\$1,300.00
18	Bumper Blocks (existing reinstalled)	EA	7	\$30.00	\$210.00	\$67.43	\$472.01	\$50.00	\$350.00
19	Landscaping	LS	1	\$28,743.00	\$28,743.00	\$19,853.96	\$19,853.96	\$27,178.00	\$27,178.00
TOTAL PROJECT COST				\$198,043.35		\$266,758.86		\$221,620.00	

Councilman Reishman moved to approve the Resolution. Councilman Ware seconded the motion. With a majority of members elected recorded thereon as voting in the affirmative the Mayor declared Resolution 815-16 adopted.

14. Your committee on Finance has had under consideration the following resolution, and reports the same to Council with the recommendation that Resolution No. 816-16 do pass.

Resolution No. 816-16: Authorizing the Mayor or City Manager to Receive and administer \$78,000 from the WV Homeland Security Administrative Agency for the upgrade of the surveillance camera system at City Hall and the City Service Center.

Be it Resolved by the Council of the City of Charleston, West Virginia:

That the Mayor or City Manager is hereby authorized and directed to Receive and administer \$78,000 from the WV Homeland Security Administrative Agency for the upgrade of the surveillance camera system at City Hall and the City Service Center.

Councilman Reishman moved to approve the Resolution. Councilman Ware seconded the motion. With a majority of members elected recorded thereon as voting in the affirmative the Mayor declared Resolution 816-16 adopted.

15. Your committee on Finance has had under consideration the following committee report, and reports the same to Council with the recommendation that committee report pass.

A proposal submitted by Pierce Manufacturing, Inc. in the amount of \$536,511.00 for purchase of One (1) PIERCE – 2000 GPM Triple Combination Pumper Truck to be used by the Charleston Fire Department. The cost submitted by Pierce for the new apparatus was \$561,792.00, however, the City wishes to exercise Option #1 in the bid specification and pay for the unit in full within a 15 day period from acceptance of contract and receive a reduction of \$25,280.00.

To be charged to Account No. 001-976-00-706-4-459, Fire Department, Capital Outlay - Equipment

Councilman Reishman moved to approve the Committee Report. Councilman Lane seconded the motion. With a majority of members elected recorded thereon as voting in the affirmative the Mayor declared the Committee Report adopted.

REPORTS OF OFFICERS

1. Policemen's and Firemen's Pension Funds- Update Report as of July 1, 2015
Received and Filed.

NEW BILLS

Introduced by Council member Robert Reishman on October 3, 2016:

Bill No. 7714- A Bill authorizing a First Supplemental Contract of Lease-Purchase with the West Virginia Economic Development Authority; authorizing improvements to the baseball stadium; authorizing the refunding of certain outstanding bonds of, and issuance of new bonds of, the West Virginia Economic Development Authority relating thereto and the execution and delivery of the First Supplemental Contract of Lease-Purchase and related documents; authorizing the execution and delivery of a continuing disclosure agreement and a final official statement; taking all other actions relating to such transactions.

Refer to Finance Committee.

Introduced by Council member Samuel Minardi on October 3, 2016:

Bill No. 7715- A Bill to establish a 15 MPH Speed Limit on Georgetown Place and amending the Traffic Control Map and Traffic Control File.

Refer to Streets and Traffic Committee.

ADJOURNMENT

The Clerk, JB Akers, called the closing roll call:

YEAS: Burka, Burton, Ceperley, Chestnut, Davis, Ealy, Faegre, Haas, Harrison, Hoover, Ireland, Lane, Miller, Minardi, Overstreet, Persinger, Reishman, Richardson, Salisbury, Smith, Steele, Talkington, Mayor Jones

NAYS: NONE

ABSENT: Clowser, Slater, Snodgrass, Ware

At 7:20 p.m., by a motion from Councilmember Harrison, Council adjourned until Monday, October 17, 2016, at 7:00 p.m., in the Council Chamber in City Hall.

Danny Jones, Honorable Mayor

JB Akers, City Clerk